RFP 2013-313: Estray Animal Services Recap Sheet

Opening Date: June 6, 2013, 3:00 p.m., at Johnson County Purchasing Office

Vendor Address Per Animal Boarding per Day Delivery Return Fee	Vendor 1 Northside Veterinary Cleburne, TX Large animal Pickup/Disposal fee: \$230.00 No bid No bid	Alvarado Veterinary Alvarado, TX	Vendor 3 Darby's Estray Animals Grandview, TX Bulls, Cows, Horses, Llamas – first 2: \$95.00 ea Calves – first 2: \$75.00 ea All additional animals: \$50.00 ea Sheep, goats, hogs, birds: \$50.00 ea 1st 5 day: \$15.00 ea/day 2nd 5 days: \$10.00 ea/day Fee P/A after \$5.00 ea/day Fee P/A after \$5.00 ea/day
Delivery Return Fee	No bid	O	\$60.00 per animal
Transport to Veterinary	No bid	JJ	\$60.00 per trip to Vet \$100.00 per trip to Humane Society
Original & 3 copies	Yes	Ι€	Yes
References	Yes	Ļ	Yes
Residence Cert	Yes		Yes
W9 Form	Yes		Yes
Vendor Notes			Quarantine of Animals: \$7.00 extra per day Any call over 20 miles from pens: \$1.50 per mile Livestock penned on site: \$60.00 first animal; remaining animals penned: \$30.00 each Call Our Fee: \$95.00 – to cover owner claim prior to arrival

Attest:Hea
Heather
Carmichael,
Buyer; Pa
r; Pam Causey
, Asst. Pi
urchasing A
gent